
E9AMQ1Z0KU0Y > eBook » Constitutional Facial Acupuncture

 

Constitutional Facial Acupuncture

Filesize: 8.11 MB

 

Reviews

It is really an remarkable book which i have ever go through. It can be writter in simple terms and not
difficult to understand. I am just effortlessly can get a enjoyment of reading a composed pdf.
(Dr . Lily Wunsch II)   

 

DISC L A IM ER      | DM C A 
 

http://www.readnow.site/disclaimer.html
http://www.readnow.site/dmca.html


NRA4KXPNCBUJ ~ Book « Constitutional Facial Acupuncture

CONSTITUTIONAL FACIAL ACUPUNCTURE

To download Constitutiona l Fa cia l Acupunctur e       PDF, make sure you refer to the link listed below and
download the file or have accessibility to other information that are relevant to CONSTITUTIONAL FACIAL
ACUPUNCTURE ebook.

Elsevier Health Sciences, United Kingdom, 2014. Paperback. Book Condition: New. 240 x 182 mm. Language:
English . Brand New Book. The author has created is a safe, painless and eCective treatment for renewing the
face and the body. It is a safe, painless and eCective treatment for renewing the face and the body. This book
supports the program, and can be used as a self-contained course in the skills covered. Constitutional Facial
Acupuncture is a safe, painless and eCective treatment for renewing the face and the body. Fine lines may be
entirely erased, deep lines reduced and bags around the neck and eyes firmed. This protocol is based upon the
use of acu-muscle points and Wakefield explains in detail how to use these specially selected acupuncture points
in tandem with muscle structure. The constitutional underpins this approach to facial acupuncture needling -
every patient is treated according to their specific constitutional pattern. Facial acupuncture diCers from
cosmetic acupuncture in this way. According to Chinese physiognomy, the shape of the face, its colouration
and its wrinkles are representative of the balance or imbalance of the organ systems and the emotional core of
the patient. Fine needles are placed at a variety of acupuncture points on the face, neck and around the eyes to
simulate the body s natural energies (qi). Since muscle groups are addressed as well as acupuncture points, the
face liFs itself, via the acupuncture points, through the muscles toning and tightening action. The needles also
stimulate blood and circulation, improving facial colour. The book will introduce a complete facial and
recommended constitutional treatment protocol including needling instructions, charts and photos that will
clarify the details of the treatments. This is a full topical Chinese herbal treatment for the face that can be
integrated with facial needling to achieve...
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